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本荘　哲先生

英文の校正が戻ってまいりましたので、転送いたします。
よく見てくれていると思いますが、疫学的に間違って直されている
場所もあるかもしれません。
適当に取捨選択してご投稿ください
Invoiceは、こちらで処理しましたのでご心配なく。

三輪　正直

-----Forwarded message-----
From: BiomEditor - Tim Taylor <taylort@biomeditor.com>
To: Masanao Miwa <m_miwa@nagahama-i-bio.ac.jp>
Date: Wed, 18 May 2022 05:32:32
Subject: Revised manuscript 19007

Revised manuscript 19007 May 17, 2022

Dear Dr. Miwa:

The revision of your manuscript is complete.  Please send me a reply to confirm that you received
this Email.

Attached to this Email are the following documents:

- your revised manuscript in which the Microsoft Word “track changes” are not shown (“Revised MS”)
- your revised manuscript with “track changes” shown (“MS Redlines”)
- your revised cover letter (“Revised Letter”, and redlines document “Letter Redlines”)
- your revised Excel tables
- our Analysis Document (the first page of this document contains general information on our
revision)
- our invoice (PDF)

We recommend that you use the “Revised MS” file as your working document and refer to the “MS
Redlines” document as necessary.

General note (mentioned to each client): Your manuscript may have required extensive revision and
comments. Thus, please consider our current revision and make appropriate changes where



necessary. Thereafter, if you feel you would like us to re-read your updated manuscript (i.e., to correct
any English mistakes introduced during your update), then please send it to us again. Indeed, if your
manuscript has undergone extensive revision, then an additional round of revision may be
particularly helpful (and perhaps necessary).

Additional Note: If you choose to re-send your updated manuscript to us for a final revision, then
later we will send you an updated invoice that reflects the fee for both our current revision and final
revision.

Thank you for allowing us to assist you with the publication of your manuscript. Sincerely yours,  Tim
Taylor
------------------------------------------------------
Timothy C. Taylor, Ph.D.
Chief Science Officer
BiomEditor, International Bioscience Consultants
https://nam12.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?
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08da3874ca32%7C84df9e7fe9f640afb435aaaaaaaaaaaa%7C1%7C0%7C637884371557773524%7CUn
known%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0
%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&amp;sdata=TZrv0vLKGHOSG%2B%2BJDNnVQJgrkz%2BH%2B3UT%2Fulf
1t4ztOE%3D&amp;reserved=0
taylort@biomeditor.com

https://nam12.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.biomeditor.com%2F&amp;data=05%7C01%7C%7C39585975a763480afcae08da3874ca32%7C84df9e7fe9f640afb435aaaaaaaaaaaa%7C1%7C0%7C637884371557773524%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&amp;sdata=TZrv0vLKGHOSG%2B%2BJDNnVQJgrkz%2BH%2B3UT%2Fulf1t4ztOE%3D&amp;reserved=0

